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Although brief intervention (BI) for alcohol and other
drug problems has been associated with decreased levels
of self-reported substance use, there is little information
in the literature as to whether individuals with co-occur-
ring hazardous substance use and mental illness would
benefit from BI to the same extent as those without men-
tal illness, despite high estimates comorbidity. This study
took advantage of a naturalistic situation where a screen-
ing, brief intervention, and referral to treatment (SBIRT)
program had been implemented in a large hospital emer-
gency department in Seattle, WA. A subset of patients
who received BI was interviewed six months following
the intervention about current alcohol/drug use. A search
of the patients’ medical records allowed us to divide the
sample into those with and without evidence of mental
illness and to analyze their self-reported drug use.
Although unadjusted means indicated a possible decrease
in illegal drug use between baseline and follow-up inter-
views for both groups, there was no significant difference
between mentally ill and non-mentally ill subgroups with
regard to self-reported changes in substance use.
Changes in self-reported alcohol and binge drinking days
showed a similar pattern. Although the lack of a compar-
ison group prevented us from attributing change in
reported use to BI alone, these data suggest the impact of
BI on subsequent drug and alcohol use may not differ
among patients with mental-health diagnoses.
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